@ ST

" PAULS

" CHAMBERS

Ronona ¢

Professional Fees of

Hannah Lynch
VAT Reglstration No;

DX: 68810 Northailerton 2
North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

artention [N

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 14 April 2015

Hannah Lynch

St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

Leeds

LS1 25P

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

www.stpaulschambars.com

Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on all correspondence

Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
11 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
12 Aug 2014, Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
13 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
14 Aug 2014 Conference 450,00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
15 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
18 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD | (@ . visa
TOTAL DUE £C/Ffwp | EB VISA
Please make cheque payable to Hannah Lynch
This fee note supersedes previous feé notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Meridian Law Limited



Professional Fees of
Hannah Lynch

Hannah Lynch
St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House

_.‘ m ‘ VAT Registration No: 2 Park&l:::
ety medt ot Ls1 25p

" CHAMBERS
TR Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
: clerks@stpaulschambers,com
www.stpaulschambers.com

m

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2
North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

atcention |

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Case Ref No : 131354

Please quote on oif torrespondence

Date: 14 April 2015

Page no: 2
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings CrimInal
Leeds High Court: {Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page}) Fees B/FWD 2880.00 576.00
19 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
20 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
21 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
22 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
02 Oct 2014 Preparation Work 26th August 2014 to Date 2170.00 434,00
31 hrs
08 Oct 2014 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS (Total 5760.00 inv 4) -4800.00 -960.00
Fees Rate vAar TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD Qf; . VISA
TOTAL DUE £c/Fwp | & Vs
Please make cheque payable to Hannah Lynch
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Meridian Law Limited



ST

Professional Fees of
Hannah Lynch

Hannah Lynch
St Pauls Chambers
2nd Floor Trafalgar House

PAULS VAT Registration No: 29 Park Place

v EAL , { Leeds
= CHAMBERS LS1 2sP
Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2 E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

North Yorkshire Police www.stpaulschambers.com

Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Case Ref No . 131354
Please quote on all correspondence

Date: 14 April 2015

Page no: 3
Operation Hyson {formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 2170.00 434.00
10 Oct 2014 Conference

04 Nov 2014 Preparation 8th October to date 58 hrs 4060.00 812,00
14 Nov 2014 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 187751 -6230.00 -1246.,00

(Total 7476.00 Inv 17)
01 Dec 2014 Spreadsheet work 3 hrs 210.00 42.00
02 Dec 2014 Spreadsheet work 1 hr 70.00 14.00
08 Dec 2014 Spreadsheet work 4.5 315.00 63.00
18 Dec 2014 Conference 1.5 hrs 105.00 21.00
29 Dec 2014 Research for Pleadings 4.5 hrs 315.00 63.00
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL.FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD | & - visa
TOTAL DUE £c/Fwp | ED VIsA
Please make cheque payable to Hannah Lynch

This fee note supersedes previaus fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Meridian Law Limited



Professional Fees of

Hannah Lynch
St Pauls Chambers

Hannah Lyn ch 2nd Floor Trafalgar House
VAT Reglstration No: 29 Park Place
Leeds

LS1 25P

Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
www, chambers.co

m

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2
North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Case Ref No : 131354

Date: 14 Aprif 2015
Please quote on ail correspondence

Pageno: 4
Operation Hyson {formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date Description of Work Fees . VAT
{Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 1015.00 203.00
30 Dec 2014 Drafting Skeleton 6.5 hrs 455.00 91.00
31 Dec 2014 Drafting Skeleton and Order 3.5 245.00 49,00
02 Jan 2015 Drafting Skeleton and Order 5 hrs 350.00 70.00
08 Jan 2015 Emails 30 minutes 35.00 7.00
09 Jan 2015 Emails and Discussions with Ford and Warren 2 hrs 140.00 28.00
12 Jan 2015 Emails and Spreadsheet 1 hr 70.00 14.00
13 Jan 2015 Conference 8.5 hrs inclusing travel 595.00 119.00
09 Feb 2015 Injunctive Relief Hearing 2400.00 480.00
20 hours pre-hearing preparation and £1000

Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accapted
TOTAL VAT EC/FWD | (&5  VIsA
TOTAL DUE £¢/rwp | ED VIsA
Please make cheque payable to Hannah Lynch

This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Meridian Law Limited



Professional Fees of
Hannah Lynch

VAT Registration No;

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2
North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 14 April 2015

‘Hannah Lynch

St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

Leads

LS1 2sp

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

www,stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on ofl correspondence

(Total 6366.00 Inv 54)

hour

Page no: 5
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
{Continued from previous page) fees B/FWD 5305.00 1061.00
09 Feb 2015 apperance fee.
23 Mar 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS - 188037 -5305.00 -1061.00

31 Mar 2015 * Reviewing letter from the other side and making
points for Lading Counsel to draft response. 1

Note: Items marked "*' are previously unbilled

70.00 14.00

Fees Rate VAT

70.00 20.00% 14.00
TOTAL DUE

TOTAL FEES

£70.00 | Card Payments
Accepted

£14.00 @, « VISA

£84.00 | &5 VIsA

BECTRON

Please make cheque payable to Hannah Lynch

This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights

THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE

Meridian Law Umited

}ﬂ(..zf«-—a 777

/’-f/‘f//s



[NANIENTY

Mr Simon Myerson QC

Mriners. Professional Fees of St Pauls Chambers
fosie % P Mr Simon Myerson QC 2nd Floor Trafalgar House
&3 ' 29 Park Place

g = UL S T VIYRISO
\ [ 151 2sp

“ CHAMBER 5

¥y Tel : 0113-245 5866
: Fax : 0113-245 5807
DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2 E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
North Yorkshire Police www,.stpaulschambers.com
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton
DL7 9HA
| Attention :-
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 14 April 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on ol correspondence
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date _ Description Qf Work Fees VAT
06 Aug 2014 Conference - 4 34 hours 2625.00 525.00
prep - 4 hours
15 Oct 2014 Conference - 1-3 1200.00 240.00
Prep - 2 hours
Telephone conversation betweek counsel and 300.00 60.00

Solicitor - 1 hour

02 Dec 2014 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 187803 -4125.00 -825.00
(Total 4950.00 Inv 85)

18 Dec 2014 Conference 1.5 hrs 600.00 120.00
Prep. 30 mins
13 Jan 2015 Conference 3 hours 30 mins. 2700.00 540.00

Prep. on Skeleton and Order 4 hours
Travel time 1 hour 30 mins.

Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES EC/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted

TOTAL VAT | EC/FWD | @ . visA

TOTAL DUE EC/FWD Vs

Please make cheque payable to Mr Simon Myerson QC

This fee note supersedes previous fee notes
LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Meridian Law Limited




VAT Registration No:

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2
North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 14 April 2015

Professional Fees of
Mr Simon Myerson QC

Mr Simon Myerson QC
St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House

29 Park Place
Leeds
LS1 28pP

Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sg
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

www.stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on all correspandence

Page no: 2
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
{Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 3300.00 660.00
26 Jan 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 187908 -3300.00 -660.00
(Total 3960.00 Inv 89)
09 Feb 2015 Injunctive Relief Hearing. 9000.00 1800.00
Preparation 15 hours @ £300 p/h
Skeleton - 5 hours @ £300 p/h
Daily attendance fee £3000
23 Feb 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 187965 -9000.00 -1800.00
{Total 20800.00 Inv 92)
24 Mar 2015 | * Conferencee_- 1 hour. 450.00 90.00
Preparation 30 mins.
27 Mar 2015 | * Reviewing letter drafted by Ford & Warren - 1 hour 300.00 60.00
Note: Items marked "*' are previously unbilled
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD . . VISA
TOTAL DUE £C/FwD | &y VisA
Please make cheque payable to Mr Simon Myerson QC
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights

THIS.IS NOT A TAX INVOICE

Meridian Law Limited



Mr Simon Myerson QC

ST 8 Mr Simon Myerson QC 2nd Floor Trafalgar House
‘P AULS VAT Registration No: 29 Park Place
o S e
CHAMBERS , .‘ Ls1 25p
\- Ak / Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax : 0113-245 5807
DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
DX: 68810 Northallerton 2 E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
North Yorkshire Police www.stpaulschambers.com
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton
DL7 9HA
L astention :
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 14 April 2015 Case Ref No - 131354
Page no: 3 Please quote on all correspondence
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : (Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 750.00 150.00
29 Mar 2015 | * Correcting the letter - 1 hour 300.00 60.00
31 Mar 2015 * Drafting a feponse to the letter received from the 450.00 90,00

other side in conjunction with Junior counsel's
response. 1 hour 30 mins.

Note: Items marked "*' are previously unbilled

Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £1500,00 | Card Payments
Accepted

1500.00 20.00% 300.00 TOTAL VAT £300.00 | & . wisa
TOTAL DUE £1800.00 | &P VisA

LECTRON

Please make cheque payable to Mr Simon Myerson QC

This fee note supersedes previous fee notes
LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Meridian Law Limited

flome ooy

e /4»/«»/5'




Your Ref.

Client;

Payable by:

Address:

FUKDU & VWWAKKEN

Solicitors

Westgate Point, Westgate, Leeds, LS1 2AX | MDX 706968 Leeds
: Email: clientmail@forwarn.com | Web Site: forwarmn.com
Switchboard 0113 243 6601 | Fax 0113 242 0905

Our Ref. Bill Number V.A.T Regd. No.

North Yorkshire_ Police
North Yorkshire Police

Legal Services Department

Date
30 April 2015

Partners:

Nicholas Collins (Senior)
Blaise Smith

Peter McWilllams (Managlng)
lain Davison

Mark Crabtree

John Coen

Ben Mackenzie

Ben Daniel

Michelle Mathers

Oliver Nelson

Lindsay Staddon
Charles Heppenstall

Assoclates:

Philip Taylor

Nigel Price

Ben Lowe

Nick Fellon

Chris Luscombe

John Robson (Executive)
Patrick Raywood (Executive)
Mark Cox

Sarah Turner

Nick Newman

John Weeks

Victoria Robertson

Consultants:
Edward Brown
Gary Hodgson

Thig firm Is authorised

and regulated by the
Solicitors Regulation Authorlty
(SRA No. 48427) and by the
Financial Conduct Authority
{FRN 623493)

2



Newby Wiske Hall

Northallerton

North Yorkshire

DL7 9HA
Fees for professional services in relation to: £
Acting on your behalf from 1 April 2015 to 30 April 2015.
COSTS (see overleaf) £10,929.1

2

SUB TOTAL £10,929.12
VAT @ 20% - £2,185.82
TOTAL PAYABLE Lo £13,114.94
WITH THE COMPLIMENTS OF ‘

Terms - 30 DAYS: YOUR ATTENTION IS DRAWN TO THE NOTICE OVERLEAF
If you would like a receipt, please return this page of the account with your payment

SOLICITORS ACT 1974
THE SOLICITORS' (NON-CONTENTIOUS BUSINESS) REMUNERATION ORDER 2009

Unless the bill overleaf is marked as being on account of work done then the following applies:

1 If you are not satisfied with the amount of our bill then Sections 70, 71 and 72 of the Solicitors Act 1974
sets out your right in relation to having the bill assessed by the court but you may be required by the
court to pay the additional costs incurred.

2 We are entitled to charge interest on the outstanding amount of the bill, (in so far as the bill relates to

non-contentious business in accordance with Atticle 5 of the Solicitors (Non-Contentious Business)

Invoice 29 April 15.docx

Produced byl



Remuneration Order 2009), and will do 50 at the rate payable on judgment debts from one month after
delivery of our bill. A

3 If, after the expiration of one month from ‘El"éli&éry, this bill remains unpaid, we will be entitled to seek
to enforce payment of it, together with interest through the court.

Invoice 29 April 15.docx

Produced byl



Please return this slip if you do not require a receipt,

Client: North Yorkshire Police
Payable by: North Yorkshire Police
Our ref: _ '
Total payable: £13,114.94

Date: 30 April 2015

Bill No:

PAYMENT METHODS

Payments are accepted by most major,credit and debit cards subject to a small surcharge,
dependent on the type of card used. These surcharges are waived if payment is made within our 30
day terms. If you wish to make payment by bank transfer please see our bank details below.
Please remember to include our reference :s:g.t'hat your payment can be allocated correctly.

Invoice 29 April 15.docx



Telephone calls 1.5 hours

Drafting . -1.0 hours
Perusal and consideration 11.7 hours
Travel 1.5 hours
Letters, dictation and correspondence 14.2 hours
32.4 hours x £130 =

Work done by-@ £110 per hour

Attendance 4.3 hours
Telephone calls 2.3 hours
Drafting (relating mainly to draft schedule) 22.7 hours
Perusal and consideration 19.0 hours
Letters, dictation and correspondence 2.1 hours

hours x £110 =
Work done b)_ @ £110 per hour
Telephone calls 0.4 hours
Perusal and consideration (relating to 8.8 hours
ireiaration of draft schedule to go to '

9.2 hours x £110 =
Photocopying charges

" TOTAL

Invoice 29 April 15.doex

£4,212.00

£5,544.00

£1,012.00

£161.12

£10,929.12



Your Ref.

Client;
Payable by:

Address:

L e e SRS

FORD & WARREN

Westgate Point, Westgate, Leeds, LS1 2AX | MDX 706968 Leeds
Emall: clientmail@forwarn.com | Web Site: forwarn.com
Switchboard 0113 243 6801 | Fax 0113 242 0905

Qur Ref,

North Yorkshire Police
North Yorkshire Police

Legal Services Department
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

North Yorkshire

DL7 9HA

Blll Number

Date
12 May 2015

V.A.T Regd. No.

REVISED DISBURSEMENT INVOICE

l Agent's Fee

l Courier Fee

NORTH YORKSHIRE POLICE INVOICE AUTHORISATION SLIP KYe-¥ig

GOODS/SERVICES RECEIVED

PRICES and CALCULATIONS

| Signature _| Signature
suB . P,
costcentre | NOMNAL | analysist | awauvsisz T XVAT | var
CODE CODE e P CODE
NET TOTAL lQZ"( Do
INVOICE TOTAL oz 1o

WITH THE COMPLIMENTS ©F /= © v A f,

-AF

Terms - 30 DAYS: YOUR ATTENT'Ytl}N IS DRAWN TO THE NOT.

o v
ELWL RS L0 <4 A 9 &)

¢ -

Partners:

Nicholas Collins {Senior)
Blalse Smith

Peter McWilliams (Managing}
lain Davigon

Mark Crebtree

John Coen

Ben iMackenzle

Ban Danlel

Michelle Mathers

Oliver Nelson

Lindsay Staddon
Charies Heppenstali

£180.00
£859.20

Aszsociates:

1 Phillp Taylor
Nigel Price

Ben Lowe

Nick Felton

Chrls Luscombe

John Robson {Executive)
Patrick Raywaod {Executive)
Mark Cox

Sarah Turner

Nick Newman

John Weaks

Victoria Robertson

Consuitants:
Edward Brown
Gary Hodgson

This firm is authorised

and regulated by the
Solicitors Regulation Authority
(SRA No. 48427) end by the
Financlal Conduct Authority
(FRN 623493)

£1,039.20

If you would like a receipt, please return this page of the account with your payment

i



Your Ref.

Client:
Payable by:
Address:

Qur Ref.

FORD & WARREN

Solicitors

Waestgate Point, Westgate, Leeds, LS1 2AX | MDX 706968 Leeds

Email: dientmali@forwarn.com | Web Site: forwam.com
Switchboard 0113 243 6601 | Fax 0113 242 0905

B8l Number

599324 Rk

North Yorkshire Police
North Yorkshire Police

Legal Services Department
Newby Wiske Hall

Northallerton
North Yorkshire

DL7 9HA

VAT Regd. No.

Date
29 May 2015

pua B

oo\ g S

SUB TOTAL

NORTH YORKSHIRE POLICE INVOICE AUTHORISATION SLIP 0SobC

Fees for professional services in relation to:
Acting on your behalf from 1 May 2015 to 29 May 2015
COSTS (see overleaf)

GOODS/SERVICES RECEIVED

PRICES and CALCULATIONS

Signatu"-

COSTCENTRE | NOMINAL

Signature

SUB
ANALYSIS 1
CODE

sUB
ANALYSIS 2
CODE

AMOUNT Ex VAT

£ p

VAT
CODE

CODE
A%0d WULiad

OB 0K

S, 2Sb

81

4

INVOICE AUTHORISED

NET TOTAL

S2sb |39

VAT

oS\ (3%

S"gnaiure

INVOICE TOTAL

b3ox |2%

WITH THE COMPLIMEN 15 OF

LA LATYYNLETY

Terms - 30 DAYS: YOUR ATTENTIC®N IS DRAWN TO THE NOTICE

1f you would like a recelpt, please return this page of the account with your payment

£5,256.89

£5,256.89
£1,051.38

Partners:

Nicholas Collins (Senlor)
Blalea Smith

Peter McWilllams (Manwlnn)
lain Davison

erk Crablree

John Coen

Ben Msckenzle

Ban Daniel

Michelle Mathers

i mosl.lv;r Nelson
Staddon

Charles Heppenstall

Asloc_lrnt;a:
Philip Taylor
Nigel Prica
Ben Lowe

Nick Felton

Chris Luscombe

John Robson EEx.cuﬁvlg
Patrick Reywood (Executive
Mark Cox

Sarah Turner

Nick Newman

John Weeks

Victoria Robertson

Consultants:
Edward Brown
Gary Hodgson

This firm Is authorisad

and regulatad by the
Solloitors R Authority
(SRA No. and by the
Financlal Conduet Authority
(FRN 823483)

oe, ’&08]\‘1-




Work done by_@ £130 per hour

Telephone calls 1.6 hours
Drafting 1.0 hour

Perusal and consideration 3.5 hours
Letters, dictation and correspondence 6.1 hours

12.2 hours x £130 = £1,586.00

Work done by solicitors _ @ £110 per hour

Attendance 1.0 hour

Telephone calls 1.0 hour

Drafting (relating mainly to draft schedule) 10.9 hours

Perusal and consideration 18.5 hours

Letters, dictation and correspondence 1.4 hours
32.8 hours x £110 = £3,608.00

Photocopying charges £62.89
TOTAL £5,256.89

34476-1 Invoice 28 Mav 15.0dt



Wastgate Point, Westgate, Leeds,
Email: cllentmali@forwa

FORD & WARREN

~

LS1 2AX | MDX 706968 Loeds
rn.com | Web Site: forwarn.com
Switchboard 0113 243 €601 | Fax 0113 242 0905

Your Re. Our Ref, Bl Number  V.AT Regd. No. Date
B 600500 NN
Client: North Yorkshire Police
Payable by: North Yorkshire Police
Address: Legal Services Department “Cobe fLood
Newby Wiske Hall N
Northallerton Q. orA§
North Yorkshire
DL7 9HA
Fees for professional services in relation to: £
Acting on your behalf from 1 June 2015 to 30 June 2015
COSTS (see overleaf) Nicholas Collln:zm:;
Blaise Smith
£4,399,87 | Petor McWitams {Managing)
Johr Cosn
Ben Mackenzie
Ben Dardel
Michelle Mathers
SUB TOTAL £4,399,87 lheey
# Clmuen:‘;zppenm
VAT @ 20% £879,97
Assoglates
Ngel P
Nk Foon
Disbursemmts John Rolggnm Bawﬂvza
Court Application Fee (F&W paid) £155.00 | Ptrick Raywood 53::;:«;}
Serah T
ORKSHIRE POLICE INVOICE AUTHORISATION SLIP Mgm%
NORTH Y Vistor :
GOODS/SERVICES RECEIVED PRICES and CALCULATIONS - -
Consultants:
gaon
ey This firm Is authorised
AMOUNT Ex VAT
F— Nong:;lEAL ANALYSIS 1 | ANALYSIS2 . . L8 s%@n‘fﬁ‘%{:ﬁ?‘?ﬁmﬁ
c o o 399 %2 0V Financlal Condw;;‘\mhyorky
U0 | lald OO0 | — Y ‘ {FRN 623493)
e VS B0 PS
— : £5,434.84
- :
| plenss
USSY Ky E [
VOICE AUTHORISED NET TOTAL .
o VAT 239 1B ! -
| Signature Bl oo Su3Yy By ;

e T ST,




Work done by-@ £130 per hour

Attendance 4.6 hours
Telephone calls 1.8 hours
Drafting 0.5 hours
Perusal and consideration 1.5 hours
Letters, dictation and correspondence 4.8 hours

13.2 hours x £130 = £1,716.00

hour

Telephone calls 3.3 hours
Drafting (relating mainly to draft schedule) 4.9 hours
Perusal and consideration 10.1 hours
Letters, dictation and correspondence 3.9 hours

22,2 hours x £110 = £2,442.00
Fhotocopying charges £241.87

TOTAL £4,399.87

34476-1 Invoice 30 Jun 15.0dt
Produced by

oy v ot e o 4




Frorvessional rees or St Pauls Chambers

Simon Myerson QC 2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

! | VAT Registration No:
‘ [ESER, et
‘ LS1 2sP

Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2 E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
North Yorkshire Police www.stoaulschambers.com
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton
DL7 9HA
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 6 july 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on ofl correspondence
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome} - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : (Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
06 Aug 2014 Conference - 4 34 hours 2625.00 525.00
prep - 4 hours
15 Oct 2014 Conference - 1-3 1200.00 240.00
Prep - 2 hours
Telephone conversation betweek counsel and 300.00 60.00

Solicitor -~ 1 hour

02 Dec 2014 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THAN KS ref 187803 -4125.00 -825.00
{Total 4950.00 Inv 85)

18 Dec 2014 Conference 1.5 hrs 600.00 120.00
Prep. 30 mins
13 Jan 2015 Conference 3 hours 30 mins. 2700.00 540.00

Prep. on Skeleton and Order 4 hours
Travel time 1 hour 30 mins.

Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted

TOTAL VAT £C/FWD (5} . VISA

TOTAL DUE £C/Fwp | &3 VISA

THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Simon Myerson QC

This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
Simon Myerson QC, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leads, 151 25P




\é;‘-.-—!:,ﬁ{..arthallerton 2
North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

Solicitors Ref; ** unknown **

Froiessiondl rees or
VAT Reglistration No:

Date: 6 July 2015

2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

leeds

LS1 25p

Tel: 0113-245 5866

Fax :0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

www.stpaulschambers.com

m

Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on all correspondence

Page no: 2
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 3300.00 660.00
26 Jan 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 187908 -3300.00 -660.00
(Total 3960.00 Inv 89)
09 Feb 2015 Injunctive Relief Hearing. 9000.00 1800.00
Preparation 15 hours @ £300 p/h
Skeleton - 5 hours @ £300 p/h
Daily attendance fee £3000
23 Feb 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 187965 -9000.00 -1800.00
(Total 10800.00 Inv 92)
24 Mar 2015 Conferencez_-- 1 hour. 450.00 90.00
Preparation 30 mins.
27 Mar 2015 Reviewing letter drafted by Ford & Warren - 1 hour 300.00 60.00
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD 5—‘, VISA
TOTAL DUE £c/rwp | G5 VisA
THIS 1S NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 da

+» 5t Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 25P

ys of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights



S ar e a

North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

Lastencion [

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Professional Fees of

VAT Registration No:

..orthallerton 2

Date: 6 July 2015

SL A2 Wildinver >

2nd Floor Trafalgar House

Tel ;

29 Park Place
Leeds

LS1 25P
0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

www.stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on oll correspondence

Page no: 3
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome)} - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Pubilic)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 750.00 150.00
29 Mar 2015 Correcting the letter - 1 hour 300.00 60.00
31 Mar 2015 Drafting a reponse to the letter received from the 450.00 90.00
other side in conjunction with Junior counsel's
response. 1 hour 30 mins,
20 Apr 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS - 188096 -1500.00 -300.00
(Total 1800.00 Inv 95)
25 Jun 2015 Application 3500.00 780.00
Fees Rate VAT ‘TOTAL FEES £3900.00 | Card Payments
Accepted
3900.00 20.00% 780.00 TOTAL VAT £780.00 ::; - VISA
TOTAL DUE £4680.00 | & VIA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailin

.+ St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 25P

g any reductions to preserve appeal rights

F\ﬂiﬂz I»,-{ 5

feo



Professional Fees of
Hannah Lynch

VAT Rei!stratian No:

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2
North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

DL7 BHA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 6 July 2015

Hannah Lynch

St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

Leeds

151 25p

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

www.stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on oll correspondence

Operation Hyson (formerly Rome} - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
11 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
12 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
13 Aug 2014 Conference 450,00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
14 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
15 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
18 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD @ VISA
TOTAL DUE £C/Fwp | &GB VoA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah Lynch
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductlons to preserve appeal rights
Hannah Lynch, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 2SP



p f . | F f St Pauls Chambers
roressional rees o 2nd Floor Trafalgar House

VAT Registration No: 29 Park Place
Leeds

LS1 28pP

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq

N asrthallerton 2
R . E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
| North Yorkshire Police www.stpaulschambers.com
' Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton
DL7 9HA
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 6 July 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Page no: 2 Pleose quote on all correspondence
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : (Public)
Date Description of Work i Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 2880.00 576.00
19 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
20 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
21 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
22 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
02 Oct 2014 Preparation Work 26th August 2014 to Date 2170.00 434.00
31 hrs
08 Oct 2014 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS (Total 5760.00 Inv 4) -4800.00 -960.00
Fees Rate var TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD @ VISA
TOTAL DUE £c/rwp | &3 VISA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
»+ St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 2SP



P

:&;ﬁxm s |

Professional Fees of
VAT Registration No:

S ==__. ..orthallerton 2
North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Narthallerton

DL7 9HA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 6 July 2015

St Pauls Chambers
2nd Floor Trafalgar House

Tel:

29 Park Place
Leeds

LS1 28p
0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
www.stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on all corresponderice

Page no: 3
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : (Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
{Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 2170.00 434.00
10 Oct 2014 Conference

04 Nov 2014 Preparation 8th October to date 58 hrs 4060.00 812.00
14 Nov 2014 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 187751 -6230.00 -1246.00

(Total 7476.00 Inv 17)
01 Dec 2014 Spreadsheet work 3 hrs 210.00 42.00
02 Dec 2014 Spreadsheet work 1 hr 70.00 14.00
08 Dec 2014 Spreadsheet work 4.5 315.00 63.00
18 Dec 2014 Conference 1.5 hrs 105.00 21.00
29 Dec 2014 Research for Pleadings 4.5 hrs 315.00 63.00
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD | & VISA
TOTAL DUE ec/rwp | & VISA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to

This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights

. » St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 2SP



St Pauls Chambers

- ¥ Professwnal Fees of 2nd Floor Trafalgar House
VAT Registration No: 29 Park Place

| L O Leeds

il LS1 2SP

s
. et

/

Sl eeieaw ..orthallerton 2
North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

| attention - N

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 6 July 2015

Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpautschambers.com

www.stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on all cotrespondence

Page no: 4
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : (Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
{Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 1015.00 203.00
30 Dec 2014 Drafting Skeleton 6.5 hrs 455.00 91.00
31 Dec 2014 Drafting Skeleton and Order 3.5 245.00 49.00
02 Jan 2015 Drafting Skeleton and Order 5 hrs 350.00 70.00
08 Jan 2015 Emails 30 minutes 35.00 7.00
09 Jan 2015 Emails and Discussions with Ford and Warren 2 hrs 140.00 28.00
12 Jan 2015 Emails and Spreadsheet 1 hr 70.00 14.00
13 Jan 2015 Conference 8.5 hrs inclusing travel 595.00 115.00
09 Feb 2015 Injunctive Relief Hearing 2400.00 480.00
20 hours pre-hearing preparation and £1000

Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD @ - VISA
TOTAL DUE £c/rwp | B VISA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to

This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
.. 5t Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, 151 25P



St Pauls Chambers

Professional Fees of 2nd Floor Trafalgar House
VAT Registration No: 29 Park Place
Leeds

LS1 25P

Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq

TS Ses. ..':>rthal.lerton L E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
North Yorkshire Police www.stpaulschambers.com
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton
DL7 SHA
| attention [ NN
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 6 July 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Page no: 5 Please quote on all correspondence
Operation Hyson {formerly Rome} - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date Description of Work "~ Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 5305.00 1061.00
08 Feb 2015 apperance fee.
23 Mar 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS - 188037 -5305.00 -1061.00
(Total 6366.00 Inv 54)
31 Mar 2015 Reviewing letter from the other side and making 70.00 14.00
points for Lading Counsel to draft response. 1
hour
20 Apr 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS - 188095 -70.00 -14.00
(Total 84.00 Inv 62)
25 Jun 2015 * Application 1170.00 234.00
Note: Items marked "*' are previously unbilled
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £1170,00 | Card Payments
Accepted
1170.00 20.00% 234.00 TOTAL VAT £234.00 @ . VISA
TOTAL DUE £1404.00 | &3 ViSA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ™ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
, . St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 2SP

sleart (7D
"Elel”



. Hannah Lynch
PrOfESS|ona| FeeS Of St Pauls Chamiers

ST Hannah Lynch 2nd Floor Trafalgar House
T 29 Park Place

“ PATIT VAT Registration No:

oA LD e e
CHAMBERS Ls1 2sp

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2 . : ic-‘g._e ks@stpaulschambers.com
bracriang T4 YORKSHIRE POL
North Yorkshire Police NOR A Qﬂ.\SH -.J.:ww.st aulschambers.com
Police Headquarters Ly
e
Newby Wiske Hall 14 JUL 2
Northallerton
DL7 9HA L, LHGAL §ERV!CES
| attention [N
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 13 July 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on all correspondence
Operation Hyson {formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
29 Apr 2015 * Preparation Reading papers sent through 24.04.15; 157.50 31.50
discussion with leading counsel re: advice to be
given. 2.25 hrs
30 Apr 2015 * Preparation Drafting and sending advice; telephone 140.00 28.00
discussion _2 hrs
12 May 2015 | * Preparation Reviewing witness statement in support 105.00 21.00
of application for summary judgment re: & 1.5
hrs
13 May 2015 | * Preparation Making further amendments to. 210.00 42.00
witness statement / draft order for summary
judgment. 3 hrs
Note: Items marked '*' are previously unbilled
Fees " Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £612.50 | Card Payments
Accepted
612.50 20.00% 122.50 TOTAL VAT £122.50 @ | VISA
TOTAL DUE £735.00 | @B VisA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah tynch
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AlID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
Hannah Lynch, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 2SP ’

W



F +44 (0)113 242 0905

DX 706968 Leeds

Weightmans LLP T +44 (0)113 243 6601
: Westgate Point
Weightmans Westyate
Leeds 151 2AX www.weightmans.com

Invoice
Your Ref:. Our Ref. Bill Number  V.A.T Regd. No. Date
B 0060 ME—
Client: North Yorkshire Police
Payable by: North Yorkshire Police
Address: Legal Services Department
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton
North Yorkshire
DL7 9HA
To fees for professional services in relation to: £
Acting on your behalf from 1 July 2015 to 30 July 2015
COSTS £4,186.66
SUB TOTAL £4,186.66
VAT @ 20% £837.33
Disbursement
Enquiry Agent Fee re address oi"_ £108.00
TOTAL PAYABLE £5,131.99

TN AR, e
WITH THE COMPLIMENTS OF ﬂ&"fv’ AATN _

Terms - 30 DAYS: YOUR ATTENTION IS D‘h':a \WN TO THE NOTICE OVERLEAF

if you would like a receipt, please return this page of the account with your payment

Welghtmans LLP is a Tlimited Wability partnership registered in England & Wales with registered number 0C326117 and its registered office at 100 Old Hall Street,
Livarpool L3 9Q). A full list of members iy available at the registered office. The term ‘partner’, if used, denotes a mamber of Weightmins LLP or a senior employee

of Weightmans LLP with equivalent standing and qualifications. Authorised and regulated by the Solicitors Regulation Authority.




Please return this slip if you do not require a receipt.

Client: North Yorkshire Police
Payable by: North Yorkshire Police
Our ref: [ AT
Total payable: £5,131.99
Date: 30 July 2015

Bl No: 601060

PAYMENT METHODS

Payments are accepted by most major credit and debit cards subject to a small surcharge, dependent on
the type of card used. These surcharges are waived if payment is made within our 30 day terms. If you
wish to make payment by bank transfer please see our bank details below. Please remember to include
our reference so that your payment can be allocated correctly.

34476-1 Invoice 30 Jul 15.0dt

produced by NN



Invoice

Your Ref.

Client:

Payabie by:

Address:

Our Ref,

Waightmans LL?
Westgate Point

Westgate
leeds LS1 2A%

Bill Number

V.A.T Regd. No.

T+44 (0)113 243 6601
F +44.{0)113 242 0905
DX 706968 Leed:

www.welghtmans.com

Date

B 00 I oo

North Yorkshire Pollce

North Yorkshire Police

Legal Services Department

Newby Wiske
Northallerton

Hall

North Yorkshire

DL7 SHA

’To fees for professional services in relation to:

}Actlng on your behalf from 3 August to 28 August 2015

|

COSTS

| SUE TOTAL

TVAT & 0%

NORTH YORKSHIRE POLICE INVOICE AUTHORISATION SLIP

LIVBIQOM S IUL A Fuil st of members 1y avallible at the registerad office. The term ‘parcaer! if uued, denotes a member of Wewghtrnans LLP or u sentor em ployee
of Werihtmars LP with equivalent standing and quabifications Authorised and regulated by the Solicitors Regulation Authonty.

GOODS/SERVICES RECEIVED PRICES and CALCULATIONS
Signature __ Signature
- suB sUB AMOUNT Ex VAT
NOMINAL VAT
COST CENTRE ANALYSIS1 | ANALYSIS 2
CODE CODE CODE £ p | CODE
90/ Ll eepor| o asia APl
INVOICE AUTHORISED NET TOTAL 25id. Iy
Signaiure B | oicE oA 2005 [2Y]

£2,512.71

£2,512.71
£502.54

£3,015,

nent

fice at 100 Oid Hall Street,

25,

PRE )



Weilghtmans LLP T +44 {0)113 243 6601

Weightmans | wegate b Touagt teeds
‘ e Leeds 151 2AX www.weightmans.com
Invoice
Your Ref. Our Ref. Bill Number  V.A.T Regd. No. Date
N oc I oo
2015
Client: North Yorkshire Police
Payable by: North Yorkshire Police
Address: Legal Services Department
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton
North Yorkshire
DLZ7 9HA
To fees for professional services in relation to: £
Acting on your benalf frorn 29 August to 30 September 2015
COSTS £6,258.95
SUE TOTAL £6,258.95
VAT @ 20% £1,251.79
TOTAL PAYABLE £7,510.74

' \’:) A TUAALAT
WITH THE COMPLIMENTS OF é&kﬁ@‘fL@‘ f

Terms — 30 DAYS: YOUR ATTENTION IS DRAWN TO THE NOTICE OVERLEAF
if you would like a recelpt, please return this page of the account with your payment

Wetghtnians tLP is a limitted lsblhy partnership reglstered in England 8 Wales with registered number OC32817 and s reglstered office at 100 Oid Hz)i Streat,
Uvarpoot L3 9QJ. A fuli Mat of mymbers 1> uvailable at the registered offios. The teem partoer, if used, denotes a ynember of Weigk nns LLP or # senjor emiployee
of Wasghtmans LLE with equivalant stand ing and gualfications, Authorised and regulated by the Solicitars Regulation Authority.




Please return this slip if you do not require a receipt.

Client: North Yorkshire Police
Payable by: North Yorkshire Police
Our ref: _
Total payable: £7,510.74

Date: 30 September 2015

Bill No: 602886

PAYMENT METHODS

Payments are accepted by most major credit and debit cards subject to a small surcharge, dependent on
the type of card used. These surcharges are walved if payment is made within our 30 day terms. If you
wish to make payment by bank transfer please see our bank detalls below. Please remember to Include
our reference so that your payment can be allocated correctly.

34476-1 Invoice 30 Sep 15.00¢
Produced b



Work done by -@ £130 per hour

Telephone calls 1.1 hours
Perusal and consideration 7.4 hours
Letters, drafting, dictation and correspondence 17.5 hours
26 hours x £130 = £3380.00

Work done by _.@ £110 per hour

Telephone calls 0.4 hours
Perusal and consideration 13.1 hours
Letters, dictation and correspondence 11.8 hours

253 hours x£110=  £2783.00
Photocopying charges £95.95

TOTAL £6,258.95

Monthly breakdown.odt Page1of1
Produced by



. J Hannah Lynch
Professional Fees of st pau7: giaaam\g:rs

Han nah l_ynch 2nd Floor Trafalgar House
T 1T < VAL 29 Park Place
CHAMBIERS LS1 25P
m . 19 hl\ Y Tel:0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2
North Yorkshire Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton
DL7 9HA
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 6 October 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Piease quote on all correspondence
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Criminal
Leeds High Court : {Public)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
06 Oct 2015 * OPINION 4.5 Hrs 315.00 63.00
QW AVY
Note: items marked '*' are previously unbilled
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £315.00 | CardPayments
Accepted
315.00 20.00% 63.00 TOTAL VAT £63.00 | @ visa
TOTAL DUE £378.00 | @D ViS4
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah Lynch
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
Hannah Lynch, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 2SP



Weightmans LLP T +44 (0)113 243 6601

Westgate Point F +44 (0)113 242 0905
Westgate DX 706968 Leeds
Leeds LS1 2AX www.weightmans.com
Invoice
Your Ref. Our Ref. Bill Number  V.A.T Regd. No. Date
Client: North Yorkshire Police 6 O 3 ] 3 /
Payable by: North Yorkshire Police
Address: Legal Services Department
Newby Wiske Hall
Northallerton
North Yorkshire
DL7 9HA
To fees for professional services in reiation to: £
Acting on your behalf from 1 to 30 October 2015
COSTS £3,123.84
SUB TOTAL £3,123.84
VAT @ 20% £624.77

Disbursements

TOTAL PAYABLE £3,903.61

I Y

PN “' /S rwP ’(/l
WITH THE COMPLIMENTS OF A‘* o Lg}ffh

Terms - 30 DAYS: YOUR ATTENTION IS DRAWN TO THE NOTICE OVERLEAF
If you would like a receipt, please return this page of the account with your payment

Weightmans LLP {5 a limited liabflity partnership registered in England & Wales with registered number OC32617 and its registered office at 100 Old Hall Street,
1isavnanl 12 M A £ AL ~f . be n N A nbhira Tha bmvine fesnbae el 38 eiead Avsncbce e Ve mie e £ hhhaVaban e = D8PS e o oo B e mme e mn e o




Please return this slip if you do not require a receipt.

Client: North Yorkshire Police
Payable by: North Yorkshire Police
Total payable: £3,903.61

Date: 30 October 2015

Bill No:

603737

PAYMENT METHODS

Payments are accepted by most major credit and debit cards subject to a small surcharge, dependent on
the type of card used. These surcharges are waived if payment is made within our 30 day terms. If you
wish to make payment by bank transfer please see our bank details below. Please remember to include
our reference so that your payment can be allocated correctly.

34476-1 Invoice 30 Oct 15.0dt



Weightmans LLP T +44 (0)113 243 6601
3 Westgate Point F+44 {0)113 242 0905
Wel ght mans Weslgate DX 706968 Leads
. Leeds LS1 2AX www.welghtmans.com

Invoice

Involce No: L0062034

North Yorkshire Police Account No;—

Legal Services Department Your ref:

Newby Wiske Hall Qur ref:

Northallerton ate/Tax point: 30 November 2015
North Yorkshire

DL7 9HA

Interim invoice
HYSON HARASSMENT
Re professional services

Fees and VAT VAT

Dlsbur 5 Rate Amount Total
Professional fees incurred for work up to and including £7,905.00 20% £1581.00 £9,486.00
29 November 2015 {(see overleaf)
Court Fee £155.00 0% £0.00 £155.00
Photocopying £0.70 20% £0.14 £0.84
TOTAL £8,060.70 20% £1,581.14 £9,641.84
Disbursements marked * will be settled on payment of account With the compliments of Weightmans LLP

VAT Reglstration Number:_'l’hls Involce Is payable within 7 days of Involce date uniess otherwlse agreed

Remittance advice (please return with payments)

Please make your cheque payable to:
Weightmans LLP

and send your remittance to:

Accounts, Weightmans LLP,

100 Old Hall Street,Liverpool,L3 9Q|
(always quoting our reference/invoice no)

1

Invoice no:
Amount (£)

*When paying via BACS, please always ensure that
your remittance advice [s seat to Accounts In
advance of payment arriving In our bank account

Payment from:



Notice to Clients (about your and our rights In relation to this invoice)

If you have a complaint about this bill or wish to challenge it you may do so by following our complaints
procedures avallable on request and on our web site.

There may also be a right to ohject to the bill by making a complaint to the Legal Ombudsman, and/or by
applying to the court for an assessment of the bill under Part 111 of the Solicitors Act 1974, and

If all or part of this bill remains unpaid we may be entitled to charge interest.



Work done by_@ £130 per hour

Attendance 9.3 hours
Telephone calls 1.2 hours
Travel ' 2.4 hours
Perusal and consideration 5.0 hours
Letters, drafting, dictation and correspondence 7.9 hours
.25,8 hours x £130 =

Work done by_@ £110 per hour

Attendance 9.3 hours
Telephone calls 5.6 hours
Travel 2.4 hours
Perusal and consideration 10.3 hours
Letters, dictation and correspondence 13.5 hours

41,1 hours x £110=

Work done b]—@ £110 pei' hour

Perusal and consideration - O.Z:hours
0.2 hours x £110 =

Work done by | 80 per hour

Telephone calls 0.1 hours
0.1 hours x £80 =

TOTAL

£3354.00

£4521.00

£22.00

£8.00

£7,905.00



CHAMBERS

Professional Fees of
Hannah Lynch

VAT Registration No:

'DX: 68810 Northallerton2
North Yorkshire-Police
Police Headquarters
Newby Wiske-Hall
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 2 December 2015

Hannah Lynch

St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

Leeds

LS12sp

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

wwwi.stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354
Please quote on oll correspondence

Operation Hyson {formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Civil
Leeds High Court : B90LS164 {Private)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
11 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
12 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
13 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
14 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
15 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
18 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accapted
£C/FWD | @& visa
TOTAL DUE gc/rwp | @D VisA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah Lynch
Rendered on: 16 Nov 2015

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing

Hannah Lynch, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, L51 25P

any reductions to preserve oppeal rights



Professional Fees of
Hannah Lynch

VAT Rei!stfiilii r\lo:

DX:'68810 Northallerton2 .
North Yorkshire-Police
Police:Headquarters

“Newby Wiske Hall

:Northallerton

D7 9HA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 2 December 2015

Hannah Lynch

St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

Leeds

LS125p

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

wwwi.stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354

Pageno: 2 Please quote on oll correspondence
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Civil
Leeds High Court : B90LS164 (Private)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
{Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 2880.00 576.00
19 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Traveliing Expenses 30.00 6.00
20 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
21 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
22 Aug 2014 Conference 450.00 90.00
Travelling Expenses 30.00 6.00
02 Oct 2014 Preparation Work 26th August 2014 to Date 2170.00 434,00
31 brs
08 Oct 2014 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS (Total 5760.00 Inv 4) -4800.00 -960.00
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/rwD | 5 visa
TOTAL DUE gc/rwp | @D VisA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah Lynch
Rendered on: 16 Nov 2015

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detalling any reductions to preserve appeal rights
Hannah Lynch, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafaigar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, 151 25P



Hannah tynch

Professional Fees of St Pauls Charrbars
Hannah Lyn ch 2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

VAT Registiation No:
Ls12sp

Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax ; 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park 5q

‘DXz 68810 Northallerton2 E nf o ST E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
“North Yotkshir.e: Police _ www.stpaulschambers.com
Police:Headquarters
:Newby Wiske-Hall
Northallerton
"DLT-9HA
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 2 December 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Page no: 3 Please quote on all correspondence
Operation Hyson {formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Civil
Leeds High Court : BS0LS164 (Private)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 2170.00 434.00
10 Oct 2014 Conference
04 Nov 2014 Preparation 8th October to date 58 hrs 4060.00 812.00
14 Nov 2014 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 187751 -6230.00 -1246.00
{Total 7476.00 inv 17)
01 Dec 2014 Spreadsheet work 3 hrs 210.00 42.00
02 Dec 2034 Spreadsheet work 1 hr 70.00 14.00
08 Dec 2014 Spreadsheet work 4.5 315.00 '63.00
18 Dec 2014 Conference 1.5 hrs 105.00 21.00
29 Dec 2014 Research for Pleadings 4.5 hrs 315.00 63.00
‘Fees Rote VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD @% VISA
TOTAL DUE gc/rwp | @ VIsA
THIS 1S NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah Lynch
Rendered on: 16 Nov 2015

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
Hannah Lynch, , 5t Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, 151 25P



Professional Fees of
Hannah Lynch

VAT Registration No;

‘DX: 68810 Northallerton2

Hannah Lynch

St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

Leeds

1s12sp

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

. North -Yorkshi re Police www.stpaulschambers.com
“Police Headquarters
‘Newby Wiske Hall
“Northallerton
“DL7 9HA
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 2 December 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Page no: 4 Please quote on oll correspondence
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome)} - Civil Proceedings Civil
Leeds High Court : BS0LS164 . {Private}
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
{Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 1015.00 203.00
30 Dec 2014 Drafting Skeleton 6.5 hrs 455.00 91.00
31 Dec 2014 Drafting Skeleton and Order 3.5 245.00 49.00
02 Jan 2015 Drafting Skeleton and Order 5 hrs 350.00 70.00
08 Jan 2015 Emails 30 minutes 35.00 7.00
09 jan 2015 Emails and Discussions with Ford and Warren 2 hrs 140.00 28.00
12 jan 2015 Emails and Spreadsheet 1 hr 70.00 14.00
13 Jan 2015 Conference 8.5 hrs inclusing travel 595.00 115.00
09 Feb 2015 Injunctive Relief Hearing 2400.00 480.00
20 hours pre-hearing preparation and £1000
Fees Rote VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Cerd Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD
TOTAL DUE gc/rwp | ED ViSA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah Lynch
Rendered on: 16 Nov 2015

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights

Hannah Lynch, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 25P



Professional Fees of
Hannah Lynch

VAT Reglstration No:

ST

PAULS

CHAMBERS

:DX: 68810 Northallerton2
“North Yorkshire Police
:Police:Headquarters
‘Newby:Wiske Hall
‘Northallerton

‘DL7'9HA

| ?%‘Att.émign,:;-

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 2 December 2015

Hannah Lynch

St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

Leeds

LS125P

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
www.stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354
Pleose quote on all correspondence

Pageno: 5
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Civil
Leeds High Court : BSOLS164 {Private)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
{Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 5305.00 1061.00
09 Feb 2015 apperance fee.
23 Mar 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS - 188037 -5305.00 -1061.00
(Total 6366.00 inv 54)
31 Mar 2015 Reviewing letter from the other side and making 70.00 14.00
points for Lading Counsel to draft response. 1
hour
20 Apr 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS - 188095 -70.00 -14.00
{Total 84.00 Inv 62)
29 Apr 2015 Preparation Reading papers sent through 24.04.15; 157.50 31.50
discussion with leading counsel re: advice to be
given. 2.25 hrs
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Cerd Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD %Aj VISA
TOTAL DUE £c/Fwp | @D VISA
THIS 1S NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah Lynch
Rendered on: 16 Nov 2015

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights

Hannah Lynch, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floer Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 25P



CHAMBERS

Professional Fees of
Hannah Lynch

VAT Reglstration No:

 DX:68810 Northallerton:2
North Yorkshire-Police
Police-Headquarters
‘Newby Wiske:Hall
‘Northallerton

DE79HA

sttention : |

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 2 December 2015

Hannah Lynch

St Pauls Chambers

2nd floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

Leeds

LS125p

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

www.stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354

Please quote on oll correspondence

Page no: 6
Operation Hyson {formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Civil
Leeds High Court : BOOLS164 (Private)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 157.50 31.50
30 Apr 2015 Preparation Drafting and sending advice; telephone 140.00 28.00
discussion ﬁ 2 hrs
12 May 2015 Preparation Reviewing witness statement in support 105.00 21.00
of application for summary judgment re: PH. 1.5
hrs
13 May 2015 Preparation Making further amendments to 210.00 42.00
draft order for summary
judgment. 3 hrs
25 Jun 2015 Application 1170.00 234.00
20 Jul 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 188326 -1170.00 -234.00
{Total 1404.00 Inv 94)
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £¢/FWD | @ visa
TOTAL DUE gc/rwp | @& VISA
THIS 1S NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah Lynch
Rendered on: 16 Nov 2015

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
Hannah Lyneh, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafaigar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, 131 2SP



Hannah Lynch

Professional Fees of St Pauls Chambers

ST Hannah Lyn ch 2nd Floor Trafalgar House

ij A U L S VAT Registration No: 29 Park Place
e Eae . s
CHAMBERS LS125P

Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax : 0113-245 5807

A , _ _ DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
| DX: 68810 Northallerton2 : : E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
“Police'Headquarters ]

:Newby Wiske Hall
E‘N_ortha'lle'rto_n
D7 9HA
“Attention -
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 2 December 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Pageno: 7 Please quote on all correspondence
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Civil
Leeds High Court : BS0LS164 {Private)

Date Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 612.50 122.50
27 Jul 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS -612.50 -122.50

(Total 735.00 Inv 106) \
060ct2015 | opivoNaSHYs  (alresdy bl b Wﬁ{a AR 315.00 63.00
u.ﬁ\-cx.}-qu b, Poi B 4! zt -

* o frecane #RY

16 Nov 2015 * Preparation for PTR - 6.5 hours 455.00 91.00
23 Nov 2015 * Continuing drafting of draft consent order - 70.00 14.00
1 hour
24 Nov 2015 * Continuing drafting of consent order_ 262.50 52.50
- 3.75 hours
25 Nov 2015 * Drafting skeleton argument for PTR. Liaising with 280.00 56.00

Weightmans and leading counsel re; the bundle and
draft orders. 4 hours
Note: Items marked "*' are previously unbilled

Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD | @& visa
VIS,
TOTAL DUE £c/rwp | @ VisA
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah Lynch

Rendered on: 16 Nov 2015

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
Hannah tynch, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 25P




. Hannah Lynch
Professional Fees of St Pauls Chambers
ST Hannah Lynch 2nd Floor Trafalgar House
PAUL S VAT Reglstration No: 29 Park Place
LU RS s
CHAMBERS LS1 25P
Tel : 0113-245 5866
fax : 0113-245 5807
_ . R _ ‘ _ DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
'DX:68810 Northalieiton2™ =~ o &: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
-North Yorkshire-Police- _ www.stpaulschambers.com
“Police:Headquarters :
:Newby Wiske:Hall
Northallerton
DLFOHA
‘Attention -
Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 2 December 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Pageno: 8 Please quote on all correspondence
Operatlon Hyson (formerly Rome) - Civll Proceedings Civil
Leeds High Court : BSOLS164 {Private)
Date . Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 1382.50 276.50
26 Nov 2015 * Making amendments to the skeleton requested by 140.00 28.00

leading counsel, Liaising with solicitors and

Making amendments to draft orders. 2 hours

27 Nov 2015 | * Preparation for summary judgment hearing and PTR. 450.00 98.060
Attending the hearings as junior counsel.
Preparation over lunch for PTR. - 7 hours

Pary 11,697 S0 AT
2{1 2.} )

op [Zesir

Note: items marked '*' are previously unbilied

Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £2012.50 | Cerd Payments
Accepted

2012.50 20.00% 402.50 TOTAL VAT £402.50 @ VISA
TOTAL DUE | £2415.00 | S VisA

THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Hannah Lynch

Rendered on: 16 Nov 2015

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights
Hannah Lynch, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 25P




S

PAULS

CHAMBERS

Professional Fees of
Simon Myerson QC

VAT Registration No:

DX: 68810 Northallerton 2
North Yorkshire-Police

' Police Headquarters
NewbyWiske:Hal|
Northallerton

DL7 9HA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 2 December 2015

Simon Myerson Qc

St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafaigar House
29 Park Place

Leeds

LS125P

Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax:0113-245 5807

DX :26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

Www.stpaulschambers.com

Case Ref No : 131354

Please quote on glf correspondence

Operation Hyson {formerly Rome)} - Civil Proceedings Civil
Leeds High Court : 89015164 {Private)
Date Description of Work Fees var
06 Aug 2014 Conference - 4 3/ hours 2625.00 525.00
prep- 4 hours
15 Oct 2014 Conference - 1-3 1200.00 240.00
Prep -~ 2 hours
Telephone conversation betweek counsel and 300.00 60.00
Solicitor - 1 hour
02 Dec 2014 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THAN KS ref 187803 -4125,00 -825.00
(Total 4950.00 Inv 85)
18 Dec 2014 Conference 1.5 hrs 600.00 120.00
Prep, 30 mins
13Jan 2015 Conference 3 hours 30 mins. 2700.00 540.00
Prep. on Skeleton and Order 4 hours
Travel time 1 hour 30 mins,
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD 8 VISA
TOTAL DUE £C/Fwp | @D Visa
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Simon Myerson (Em
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ Please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights

Simon Myerson QC

»» St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, 151 25p



Professional Fees of
Simon Myerson QcC

VAT Rsi"ustﬁiion i\ io:

‘DX: 68810 Northallertona
‘North:Yorkshire Police |
:PoliceHeadquarters

‘Newby Wiske:Hall

“Northallerton

i Dt?:'QHA

_%f:@?«&tﬁen,t,;lgq! _

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 2 becember 2015

Simon Myerson QC

St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

Leeds

Ls1 2sp

Tel: 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
www.stpaulsch .CO,

Case Ref No ; 131354
Please quote on aff correspondence

Pageno: 2
Operation Hyson (formerly Rome} - Civil Proceedings Civil 7
Leeds High Court : B90L$164 (Private)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
{Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 3300.00 660.00
26 Jan 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 187908 -3300.00 -660.00
(Total 3960.00 inv 89)
09 Feb 2015 Injunctive Relief Hea ring. ' 9000.00 1800.00
Preparation 15 hours @ £300 p/h
Skeleton - 5 hours @ £300 p/h
Daily attendance fee £3000
23 Feb 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 187965 -9000.00 -1800.00
(Total 10800.00 Iny 92)
24Mar 2015 | conference | . . 1o.. 450.00 90.00
Preparation 30 mins,
27 Mar 2015 Reviewing letter drafted by Ford & Warren - 1 hour 300.00 60.00
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
£C/FWD % VISA
TOTAL DUE £C/rwp | @B Visa
THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payabie to Simon Myerson Q¢
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to

Simon Myerson QC, , st Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 park Place, Leeds, 151 25p

preserve appeal rights



Simon Myerson QC
St Pauls Chambers
2nd Floor Trafalgar House

Professional Fees of
Simon Myerson QC

2 S

- . 29 Park Place
PAULS e o
CHAMBERS 1S125P

Tel : 0113-245 5866
Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq
E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com

DX::68810 Northailerton 2.

“North Yorkshire:Police. www.stpaulschambers.com
-Police:Headquarters

“Newby‘Wiske-Hall

“Northallerton’

“DL7 GHA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown **

Date: 2 December 2015 Case Ref No : 131354

Page no: 3 Please quote on alf correspondence
Operation Hyson {formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Civil
Leeds High Court : B90L5164 {Private)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 750.00 150.00
29 Mar 2015 Correcting the letter - 1 hour 300.00 60.00
31 Mar 2015 Drafting a reponse to the letter received from the 450.00 90.00
other side in conjunction with Junior counsel's
response. 1 hour 30 mins.
20 Apr 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS - 188096 -1500.00 -300.00
{Total 1800.00 tnv 95)
25 Jun 2015 Application 3900.00 780.00
20 Jul 2015 PAYMENT RECEIVED WITH THANKS ref 188327 -3500.00 -780.00
(Total 4680.00 inv 103)
27 Nov 2015 Application for Summary Judgment - At Court 4.5 2550.00 510.00
hours.
Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £C/FWD | Card Payments
Accepted
TOTAL VAT £C/FWD | 2
TOTAL DUE £c/rwp | @D VIsA
THIS 1S NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Simon Myerson QC
This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detalling any reductions to preserve appeal rights
Simon Myerson QC, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Flaor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, 151 25P



Professional Fees of
Simon Myerson QC

VAT Reglstration No:

CHAMBERS

Simon Myerson QC

St Pauls Chambers

2nd Floor Trafalgar House
29 Park Place

Leeds

151 25p

Tel : 0113-245 5866

Fax : 0113-245 5807

DX : 26410 Leeds Park Sq

DX: 68810 Northallerton2 . E: clerks@stpaulschambers.com
Nonhvorkshirepo"ce www.stgaulsghambers.cg!!
‘Police:Headquarters
:NewbyWiske:Hall
‘Northallerton
:DL79HA

Solicitors Ref: ** unknown ** Date: 2 December 2015 Case Ref No : 131354
Page no: 4 Please quote on all correspondence
Operation Hyson {formerly Rome) - Civil Proceedings Civil
: Leeds High Court : BOOLS164 {Private)
Date Description of Work Fees VAT
(Continued from previous page) Fees B/FWD 2550.00 510.00

27 Nov 2015 Preparation inc, Skeleton Argument - 4 hours.

oF [ 308y

P lozac /97
- 2?/11:.?15

Lk

e 4

Fees Rate VAT TOTAL FEES £2550.00 | Card Payments
Accepted

2550.00 20.00% 510.00 TOTAL VAT £510.00 «x»&( VISA
TOTAL DUE £3060.00 | @ VisA

THIS IS NOT A TAX INVOICE Please make cheques payable to Simon Myerson QC

This fee note supersedes previous fee notes

LEGAL AID TAXATION ~ please write within 7 days of taxation detailing any reductions to preserve appeal rights

Simon Myerson QC, , St Pauls Chambers, 2nd Floor Trafalgar House, 29 Park Place, Leeds, LS1 2SP



ey

Welghtmans Lip T+44{0)T13 243 6601
Westgate Point F +44 (0)113 242 0505
Wastgate DX 705968 Leeds

Leeds 151 2A% wwwwalghtmans.com

Invoice

Invoice Ne: LOO LLRL

North Yorkshire Police Account No::—

Legal Services Department Your ref:

Newby Wiske Hall Our ref:

Northallerton Date/Tax point: 22 December 2015
North Yorkshire

DL7 9HA

Interim Invoice
HYSON HARASSMENT
Re professional services

Feas and VAT VAT
Disbursements Raute Amou Total
Our fees up to and inciuding 21 December 2015 £1,653.00 20% £330.60 £1,983.60
Hours Rate Total

Partner 8.4 130 1092.00

Associate

Solicitor 5.1 110 561.00

Legal

Executive

Paralegal

Tralnee
TOTAL £1,653.00 20% £330,60 £1,983.60
Disbursements marked * will be settled on payment of account With the compliments of Welghtmans LLp

VAT Registration tumbe: J N x

This Involce Is payable within 7 days of Invoice date unless otherwise agreed
Office Use Only: B

Remittance advice (please return with payments)

Please make your cheque payable to: Refere l!:‘._
Welghtmans H.’PP ]e erenc

and send your remittance to:

Accaunts, Welghtmans LLP, | Bvdicenc:

100 Old Hall Street,Liverpool,L3 9Q) Amout (h

(always quoting our reference/involce no)

. "When via BACS, please always ensure that
Payment from: your remvlttanga advice lsp:nt 10 Accounts in
advance of payment arriving In our bank account




«  Work done by‘-@ £130 per hour

Attendance 0.5 hours
Telephone calls 1.8 hours
Perusal and consideration 0.3 hours

Letters, drafting, dictation and correspondence 5.8 hours

8.4 hours x £130,00= £1092,00
Work done by- £110 per hour

Attendance 0.8 hours
Telephone calls 0.4 hours
Perusal and consideration 1.3 hours
Letters, dictation and correspondence 2.6 hours

5.1 hours x £110.00= £561.00

TOTAL £1653.00




